
Naughty Bar Brawl
By BlueJay
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Across

1 Bar spoils (4)

3 Beat criminal and 
help to commit 
crime (4)

6 Bar with bubbles? 
We heard a rumour 
(5)

10 Bounds about, 
gripping unclothed 
hips, suckers! (9)

11 Gyrate temptingly, 
with intriguing red 
lips for starters (5)

12 Seen naked around 
northern European, 
perhaps, hold in 
bondage (7)

13 Catches break in 
topless bars (7)

14 Some tea, chocolate 
for everyone! (4)

16 Outdoor meal in 
park, one 
essentially eaten by 
one hundred and 
ninety-nine (6)

18 Monster with gold, 
crunchy topping (3)

21 Gentleman, one in 
saucier outfit (3)

22 Turn on, remove 
clothing, but fall 
asleep (3,3)

23 Primarily chocolate 
biscuit, without 
blue wrapping 
removed! (4)

25 Caught bucking 
bronco with grainy 
middle-ear, maybe? 
(7)

27 Drunken fool with 
rum, enough to fill 
a saloon bar, say! 
(7)

29 Present, 
misleadingly sweet 
(5)

30 Stem ginger and 
oats I chopped up 
without case of 
Guiness (9)

31 Requirements: a 
pair of glasses, 
shortly! (5)

32 Twin sticks kiss on 
twin scratching 
bottom (4)

33 Strip Korean back 
with an airy 
opening? (4)

Down

1 Shopping centre 
bullies reportedly 
having small 
crunchy balls? (9)

2 Some Anusol 
ordeal arising with 
things you may or 

may not give away 
to your loved one? 
(5)

4 Know bride 
carelessly cut the 
cheese (5,4)

5 Seed coating with 
fantastic taste (5)

6 Prepared wet rice, a 
frozen dessert, 
perhaps? (5,3)

7 Roulade Women's 
Institute entered in 
second sunday 
school register (5,4)

8 A salt turns up with 
a book of charts (5)

9 Viral mutation for 
opposition (5)

15 Filth, reading up in 
prison magazine? 
(9)

17 Fit entire cocktail 
into Egyptian 
Queen (9)

19 Spanish gentleman 
in local bar, 
intoxicated after 
drinking last of 
wine (9)

20 Take off first piece 
of underwear after 
starting to strip in 
nutty bar (8)

24 Cooked tapioca, as 
missing theme (5)

25 Socks and sleeves, 
at the end (5)

26 Amplify sounds of 
disapproval, put on 
shirt, perhaps? (5)

28 Scale of final body 
of water (5)


