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Across

1 Fault of 399m lap? 
(5,7)

8 No introduction 
provided on 
fashionable chalice's 
faults (7)

9 Faults an afterthought 
after lager knocked 
back at university (4-
3)

11 Confused backers 
backing United (5)

12 Cancellation of 
bequest to men, iPad 
broken (9)

13 Return of profits not 
one's fault (4)

15 Darling's retrospective 
diary and study again 
rely on periodic 
oversight (6,4)

18 Ring of unspecific 
position in sequence 

is twisting bit of chain 
exhibiting fault (2,3,5)

19 Derbyshire village's 
legacy ultimately 
invading West coming 
from East (4)

21 Rough gin I suggest 
can be set fire to (9)

23 Fault of troublesome 
child bumping head 
(5)

25 One lays about using 
posh wellies, etc (7)

26 Drop down to reserve 
team? (7)

27 Basis for bank to 
borrow nightclub turn 
to dance at opening of 
exhibition (8,4)

28/29 See preamble 
(5,7)

Down

1 Rearward curve like 
bones (5)

2 Round window on 
cullis used for the first 
half (6)

3 Note retreat of 
residents surrounding 
one cause of lightning 
(5,4)

4 End of Pompeii 
society girl's fault (5)

5 News item in 
scrapbook possibly 
showing activity of 
sheep farmer (8)

6 Fault fashionable 
water company, say 
(9)

7 Works of fiction the 
creators of HMS 
Pinafore placed 
around anchor 
warehouse I must 

go in! (5,7)

10 Trading environment 
established around 
fireplace brand (6,6)

14 Worker and I shall 
hold vegetable for 
film-maker (9)

16 Uproar on Web 
around Queen's 
Wedgwood collection, 
for example (6,3)

17 Trench occasionally 
collapsing into 
caverns at the 
beginning of fault (8)

20 OK by German to 
collect tatty robe for 
hopper (6)

22 Marshy area exposed 
mostly beneath tree 
(5)

24 Contact by radio fish 
on the radio? (5)


