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Across

1. Teaser ad, for short

6. Orbison who sang 
"Only the Lonely"

9. Give pointers to

13. Say yes to without 
saying "yes" (2 words)

14. Big bird in the outback

15. Big name on a judging 
panel

16. Current role for Mr. 
Lambert (2 words)

18. "Most definitely!" (2 
words)

19. Norse god of storms 
(anagram of I RAGE)

20. "Ruh-___" (Scooby-
Doo exclamation)

21. Traded verbal barbs

24. Jack who created the 
film-rating system

28. Down in the dumps

29. Assigned seating for 
16-Across (2 words)

30. ___ shark

31. Middle-earth area 
under the Misty 
Mountains (anagram of 
MAORI)

32. Sydney-to-Brisbane 
dir.

33. Type of tryout heard 
by 16-Across (2 words)

37. Neon or helium

38. Talk to a crowd

39. "Hair" song "___ 
Baby"

41. Chair-turning talent 
show (2 words)

43. Showed off, as a new 
song

45. Reiterated refusal (3 
words)

46. Nancy who was 
Adam's neighbor (and 
loves crosswords)

47. Deer friend?

48. Muscle-bone 
connector

49. Blown away (2 words)

52. Location of 41-Across

56. Searched for talent on 
social media, in a way

57. "Choice" words

58. Goofy smiles

59. Adam, for one

60. Musical tonality

61. Not a good comment 
for a contestant on a talent 
show

Down

1. ___ Park (Pittsburgh 
Pirates' stadium)

2. Aussie bouncer, briefly

3. "Ghost" role for 
Whoopee, ___ Mae

4. Cheese go-with

5. Unspecified group

6. Took it from the top

7. "Lawrence of Arabia" 
actor Sharif

8. "Deelish!"

9. Snicker sound

10. TV "Tarzan" Ron ___

11. Spike, the director (not 
the keyboardist)

12. "Great Performances" 
airer

15. Nerd's antithesis (2 
words)

17. "Let Us Now Praise 
Famous Men" author 
James

20. Forearm bones

21. Choice of sizes: Abbr.

22. Big cheeses

23. Formerly massive lake, 
now desert, in central Asia 
(2 words)

24. Green salsa variety

25. Microscopic machine

26. More cheap-sounding

27. Frustrated feeling 
when not selected, perhaps

29. Way to get from A to 
B

31. National auto body 
repair chain

34. Improvised a tune

35. Tequila or tea

36. "You didn't have to tell 
me that" (3 words)

37. Volkswagen hatchback 
model

40. LeShan who wrote 
"It's Better to Be Over the 
Hill Than Under It"

42. TV watcher

43. By ___ of (using 
effort)

44. Adam has a lot of it at 
concerts

46. 1980 Oscar winner 
who portrayed Loretta

48. "Without a doubt!"

49. Brief notes to a 
cyberbuddy

50. Small point to criticize

51. "Gimme __ _!" (start 
of a Glambert cheer)

52. "Thumbs up!"

53. Fudge the facts

54. "Shoo" additions?

55. Type of blonde


