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Across

1. Discreetly keep in the 
email loop, for short

4. Brand called "Exxon" in 
the U.S.

8. Fertile, as land

14. Sports ___ (athletic gear 
for women)

15. Bad weather for outdoor 
concerts

16. Log-rolling contests

17. *Mama RuPaul, perhaps

19. Dress extravagantly

20. Have confidence in

21. Gender identity often 
associated with they/them 
pronouns, for short

23. Actor Dullea who played 
Dave in "2001: A Space 
Odyssey"

24. "Nasty" Nastase of tennis 
fame

25. *Raja, for one

28. Points the finger at

30. "Would I ___ to You?" 
(1985 Eurythmics hit)

31. Patel of "Lion"

32. Yemen's capital, 
constitutionally

33. "A good walk spoiled," 
according to Mark Twain

35. Pops

36. *Controversial reading 
event

39. Criticism, slangily

42. Circle of virtue

43. "Hamilton" character 
Burr

47. Apple's mobile devices 
run on it

48. Leila, to Adam and Neil

49. Start to conduct? (2 
words)

50. *It might feature RuPaul 
pancakes or Trixie Mattel 
mimosas

54. Boston Bruins legend 
Phil, to fans (anagram of 
POSE)

55. Donkey, in Germany and 
crosswords (anagram of 
ELSE)

56. Couturier ___ Saint 
Laurent

57. Rheinland refusal

58. Snuck by

60. "Soo boring!", and a clue 
to a word that makes the 
starred clues make sense (3 
words)

62. "Show me the way!" (2 
words)

63. Bit of nesting material

64. Deer who raised Bambi

65. Address for a countess

66. Summers in Montreal

67. Spanish couple?

Down

1. Entree often served with a 
moist towelette (2 words)

2. Fur-loving villain ___ de 
Vil

3. One of the seven hills of 
Rome (anagram of INCA 
ALE)

4. Bert's best bud, 
affectionately

5. Swashbucklers' weapons

6. Italian city after which a 
Crayola-box color was named

7. Final year before AD (2 
words)

8. Dull finish?

9. New kid on the block

10. Dancer Debbie

11. "Heaven is a Place on 
Earth" singer Carlisle

12. Velvet Underground lead 
singer who took us for a 
"Walk on the Wild Side" (2 
words)

13. "Gift" that brings out the 
skeptics

18. Flight sleeping aid (2 
words)

22. Try to communicate with, 
at a concert (2 words)

26. Internet cafe offering, 
maybe

27. Winnebagos, briefly

29. "Mangia!"

33. Award nod for WWFM

34. Olive of "Popeye"

35. Like some streets and 
jobs (2 words)

37. "Here comes trouble!" (2 
words)

38. "Sheesh!"

39. Stretching of the truth

40. Marilyn's gold digger role

41. The same old way (2 
words)

44. Color that's also a 
Stephen King miniseries (2 
words)

45. Where Spike can be 
found during a QAL concert 
(2 words)

46. Light stuff on the strip (2 
words)

48. Common Scottish 
surname

49. Rhys Nicholson, e.g.

51. Canio's wife in 
"Pagliacci"

52. Eco-friendly party 
announcement

53. Cereal box fig.

58. Shade lover's tree

59. Letters after Schumer or 
Clinton

61. Ashcroft and Reno, e.g.: 
Abbr.


