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Across

1. Queen "I'm naked and I'm 
___ from home"

4. "R-E-S-P-E-C-T / Take 
care, ___"

7. Home to the Nobel Prizes: 
Abbr.

10. Pop's top, perhaps

13. "Wow, just wow!" feeling

14. "Strange Magic" band, 
for short

15. Symbol of sturdiness

16. Like, on a menu

17. Breakfast burrito filler

18. Desperate, as an attempt 
(3 words)

20. Doctor of law degree: 
Abbr.

21. List of dos and don'ts, 
briefly

23. Ermine in its summer 
coat (anagram of TOAST)

24. Unwanted pool plant

25. "Hot dog!"

26. One of Jupiter's moons

27. Muslim religious leader

28. Zipper opening?

29. Syringe contents, 
sometimes

30. "West Coast" singer Lana 
Del ___

31. Marcia's "Brady Bunch" 
big brother

33. Razor mishap

35. Worthy of a medal

38. "Haven't the foggiest!" (2 
words)

42. Galapagos Islands' 
country

44. Performed better than, 
per Billboard's Top 100

45. Once, once

46. With 10-Across, drink 
before bed

48. ___ Pea of Popeye 
cartoons

49. "I'm such a dope!"

50. Magazine's revenue 
sources (2 words)

52. Grandmother, to Brits

53. "Giddyup!"

55. "Eureka!" alternative

56. Tsp. or Tbsp., e.g.

58. Forgets the lyrics, say (2 
words)

61. Stage ensembles 
requiring quick changes

65. Guest's guest (2 words)

66. "Yeah, if that'll ever 
happen!" (2 words)

67. ___ Lingus (carrier to 
Dublin)

68. Tail fastener, in a party 
game

69. "That's what I'm talkin' 
about!"

70. Angsty music genre

Down

1. Mythical creature or its 
enchanted realm

2. "Shucks, you're too kind!" 
(2 words)

3. Bob or Ziggy Marley's 
genre

4. "Chopped" host Allen who 
was one of the original 
quintet on "Queer Eye for the 

Straight Guy"

5. Almost the winner (2 
words)

6. Unauthorized recording of 
a concert, e.g.

7. Late night shop for pop, 
maybe (2 words)

8. "Whoa!" (3 words)

9. Squeak (by)

10. "Let's do lunch 
sometime!" (2 words)

11. Like most of the island 
parties that Adam attended

12. Adam's nickname based 
on the Kylie Minogue song

19. Laugh heartily

22. Nanny on a farm

24. [Mwah!] (2 words)

32. Cast aside

34. Camper's resting place

35. Follow, as advice

36. Wedding stationery shade

37. When many jams happen 
(2 words)

39. Period for R&R, and 
literally, a hint to each shaded 
word

40. Home of ancient Greek 
scholars (anagram of ALEE)

41. City in Yemen on its 
namesake gulf

43. Tear into, as a wrapped 
gift (2 words)

44. "Woo-hoo!" (2 words)

47. "This is SO frustrating!"

50. Notable author of animal 
tales

51. Fills to capacity

54. Hypothethicals

57. Music or drama deg.

58. Scholastic yardstick, 
briefly

59. Women's World Cup 
"Bravo!"

60. Institute of higher 
learning, to Brits

62. Ultravox frontman Midge 
___

63. Cruise on a set

64. Hostess ___ Balls


