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Across

1. A little one will "do ya," in 
old ads

4. Katmandu natives

11. Hit a sour note or goof up 
the lyrics

14. "Likable" Prez

15. Showing passion

16. "Empire" co-creator 
Daniels

17. Green EP released in 
September 2019 (3 words)

19. AKA, in the business 
world (Anagram of 1-Across)

20. Jai ___ (literally, "merry 
festival")

21. Crafty website

22. Leader of a musical 
"Gang"

23. Response akin to "Oh 
yeah?" (2 words)

26. An Adam-signed one 
raised $1500 for Project 
Angel Food

27. Green dessert/drink 
offered at McDonald's this 
month (2 words)

31. Dec. 31st, initially

32. Composer's masterwork

33. "I'm With the Band" 
author Pamela ___ Barres

34. Gentleman caller, 
quaintly

37. "Death of a Salesman" 
salesman Willy

39. Rock ___ (Brian and 
Roger, e.g.)

40. "Green Book" Oscar 
winner Mahershala ___

41. Sudden, major progress

42. Fish with needlelike teeth

44. Green muppet of the big 
and small screen (3 words)

48. Really enjoy, slangily (2 
words)

49. Speculative stock 
purchases or sales

52. Buy before it's sold out 
(like show tickets)

53. "Superfood" in smoothies

56. Said of a clear, clean tone 
or driven snow

57. "Babe"

58. Singer, actor, LGBTQ+ 
ambassador and lover of 
green

61. Mork's home planet on 
"Mork & Mindy"

62. Ritzy Mediterranean hot 
spot

63. High, arcing tennis shot

64. Errand runners for the 
stars, briefly

65. Merged slowly, as traffic 
(2 words)

66. Crafty, like a fox

Down

1. Stars with attitudes

2. "The Jungle Book" 
wolfpack leader (Anagram of 
A LEAK)

3. Secures, as a ship's rope

4. "Born," in wedding notices

5. 911 respondent, briefly

6. Big phony

7. "Keep __ __!" ("Don't give 
up!")

8. Pot tops

9. Two-time Tony winner 
Judith whose name sounds 
like a climbing vine

10. "The Little Mermaid" 
setting

11. Legendary lost City of 
Gold

12. Changed a play date?

13. Authenticity

18. Hindu god depicted with 
four arms

22. Canadian speed limit 
abbr.

24. "Wahoo!"

25. Folded brunch dish

26. What leather pants might 
accentuate

28. Extra somethin' somethin'

29. Balancer of the books, 
briefly

30. Panda's self-defense skill, 
in a 2008 film

34. Pie and pastry place

35. Billie Holiday's real first 
name (meaning "light")

36. Scuba needs (2 words)

38. Muffin morsel, maybe

39. Second bunch to perform 
(2 words)

41. Freckled part of Adam's 
face

43. Works on a wall?

45. Make faces for the 
camera

46. Submitted tax returns 
with a click

47. Unappealing bowlfuls

50. Swashbuckling Flynn

51. Kept for later (2 words)

53. Sarah McLachlan "We 
are born innocent" song (or, 
backwards, an opera)

54. Cleveland hoopsters, 
familiarly

55. Gal pal, in Paris

58. "Happy Days ___ Here 
Again"

59. Hebrew name meaning 
"lion" (Anagram of AIR)

60. "Geez!"


