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Across

1. With 26-Across, charity 
eventy honoring George Michael

8. Boob tubes

11. Opposites of debits: Abbr.

14. Huge windfall

15. "Tee-___!"

16. L.A.'s ___ Center (Anagram 
of 3-Down)

17. Charitable world-wide star

19. U.K. music mag: Abbr.

20. Former Russian space station 
whose name means "peace"

21. 'enry 'iggens' 'ouse

22. Open court hearing, in law 
(Anagram of YORE)

23. Ming collectibles

26. See 1-Across

28. Card games for 2 players; 
played with 32 cards

30. Impolite acronym meaning 
"major screw-up"

31. Dorm room, often

32. Co. making holiday 
arrangements

34. Playground retort (2 words)

37. LGBTQ scholarship provider 
whose event was hosted by 
Michelle Collins

42. "Glee" character Abrams

43. Feather wrap

44. Exasperated outburst

45. Lobbies with trees, maybe

48. "I Will ___" (1979 Gloria 
Gaynor disco hit)

51. GLAAD concert event where 
everyone wore purple (2 words)

54. "Purple People ___" (1958 
Sheb Wooley hit)

55. "Jaywalker" of late-night TV

56. British flyers, briefly

57. Lip-reading alternative: 
Abbr.

58. Works by Hans Havenon, 
e.g.

59. Gala raising money for Little 
Brothers and Sisters (3 words)

64. Bobs, buns and beehives

65. "Catch my drift?"

66. One who has a footwear 
obsession like Adam

67. Roxy Music founder Brian

68. Albums kept in jewel boxes, 
briefly

69. Fan of the "Teenage Dream" 
singer

Down

1. Org. with balls and strikes

2. "Da Ya Think I'm Sexy?" 
singer Stewart

3. Bon Jovi's "Livin' __ _ Prayer" 
song performed at 51-Across

4. Radio signal blocker used in 
some concert venues

5. Sign up to serve

6. Peter the Great, for one

7. Bagpiper's beret

8. Booker T.'s backing band

9. Dr. Everett von Scott 
portrayer in "The Rocky Horror 
Picture Show" remake on Fox

10. Boob tube

11. Hippie archaeologist's query? 
(4 words)

12. Love-struck lad

13. Bergen's dummy, Mortimer 
___

18. "___ appetit!"

22.  "Come ___ __!" ("Gimme a 
break!")

23. Motor-scooter brand, Italian 
for "wasp"

24. Adam in "Glee". e.g.

25. "I don't believe it!" (4 words) 
or 1994 hit song by Weezer 
(Rivers Cuomo)

26. "Regarding..."

27. Popular Russian auto

29. Grade below dee

33. Add (in), as music to a film

35. Dry white Italian wine

36. "She's paying. It's __ ___!"

38. Explosive stuff, informally

39. Hatcher of "Desperate 
Housewives"

40. A little too-oo-oo interested

41. Family tree abbr.

46. "Give me an E for effort" (2 
words)

47. Pearls of wisdom

49. Filmed again, as a scene

50. ___ girl (classic ditzy type)

51. UK glam rock band with the 
hit "Cum on Feel the Noize"

52. Eva ___ (Madonna's role in 
"Evita")

53. Post for top guns, maybe: 
Abbr.

57. "Brimful of ___" 
(Cornershop hit of 1997)

59. Fan who goes berserk when 
seeing her idol?: Abbr.

60. "Fire away"

61. UNESCO-sponsored Council 
promoting the development of 
International Music-making

62. Samoan word for "boat" 
(Anagram of AVA)

63. Tolkien tree creature from 
the Old English for "giant"


