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Across

1. Does over, as "Rocky 
Horror Picture Show" by 
FOX

8. "Very interesting..."

11. "Rebel Without a Cause" 
star Mineo

14. Superhero insect of 60's 
TV whose first name sounds 
a pop star (2 words)

15. "Most certainly, 
monsieur"

16. Stockings for Eliza 
Doolittle purchased by 'enry 
'iggins, perhaps

17. "Young, old, male, 
female, Trans, Gay, Straight, 
White, Black, Asian, 
Hispanic, and every beautiful 
in-between.", e.g. (2 words)

19. Big Pharma regulator

20. Singer with the 2014 top 
10 hit "Chandelier"

21. Start of an idea... or a 
cold

22. Shutterbug's setting

24. BMW, for example

25. "...is an anthem about 
facing exactly who you are 
and ___ __."

28. "Star Trek: T.N.G." 
character Geordi ___

32. A wee bit

33. Maine University town

34. "Livin' La ___ Loca" 
(Ricky Martin hit)

36. Bo ___ (Queen song), 
informally

40. Lyrics repeated 13 times 
in the song/video featuring 
Laleh (4 words)

43. Actress Thompson of 
TV's "Family"

44. Again from the top

45. Unconventional and then 
some (Anagram of ROUTE)

46. LPs: Abbr.

48. 'Dinner's ready!' (2 
words)

50. "This video is a ___ ___ 
to all ..."

54. M.D.'s right hands

55. Tower city where 
everyone spoke the same 

language at the beginning of 
construction

56. Joined in the chorus

58. At-bat stat

61. Familiar, as a joke

62. Singer/actor/inspirer and 
now video producer (2 words)

66. __ _-TURN

67. A sip of the sauce

68. Online shopkeeper

69. Aliens might take it: 
Abbr.

70. Dr. who was the world's 
richest musical performer of 
2015 according to Forbes

71. Part of ESP

Down

1. Cheerleader's cheers

2. Decorative toiletry case

3. Guggenheim alternative in 
N.Y.C.

4. "I __ _ Rock" (Simon & 
Garfunkel tune)

5. Australian hopper

6. Sportscaster Dick whose 
memoir is subtitled "Oh My!"

7. Ending with ham or hip

8. Darlin'

9. Play to the camera

10. Square peg in a round 
hole, say

11. Start of either syllable in 
"ginger" (2 words)

12. "Same here" (3 words)

13. Eagerly accepted, with 
"at"

18. "If you ask me," in blog 
comments

23. London traffic jams: 
Hyph.

24. Chili ___ ___

26. ___ peak (forehead point)

27. Hebrew name meaning 
"sweetness"  (Anagram of 
MOAN)

28. Stock market dips

29. Field of expertise

30. Quit, in poker

31. "Nonetheless..." (2 words)

35. Ending meaning 
"resident"

37. "WWFM" and "Ghost 
Town", e.g.

38. "Hair" hair

39. Ball-shaped hammerhead

41. Soul singer Gray

42. Person that The Village 
People is singing to in 
"Y.M.C.A." (2 words)

47. Bond girl Britt of "The 
Man With the Golden Gun"

49. Elaborately embellished

50. Steak named for its shape

51. Heavenly headgear

52. "American Idol" judge

53. Armed Forces branch: 
Abbr.

57. "Light" and "dark" orders

58. Move, in Realtor lingo

59. "Song of the South" title 
for Rabbit or Fox

60. Coy reply to "Nice job!" 
(2 words)

63. Theater head: Abbr.

64. King Kong was a big one

65. People who have the best 
chance at finding a date?, 
briefly


